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(Channeling begins) 
 

 
 
Djwhal Khul here. Tashi Delek. 
 
We are at a major shift. This Super Moon over the weekend along with a lunar eclipse and the Sun 
entering Aquarius is sort of, well I want to say, the ball that is kicked at the start of the game and 
it is going to, like a football, is going to tumble high through the air and where exactly it lands you 

won’t know until it is about to land so from a spiritual perspective you want to prepare for that and 
then navigate through it.  
 
So your life is pretty much going to look like a kick-off basically. Government affairs, world affairs, 
other important issues are all going to be that sort of tumbling through the air. Where will it land? 
When will it end? How will it be? Is everything going to be okay or not okay? So that element of 
the unknown is also highly present.  
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Remember that all levels of the consciousness is programmable. So you can talk to your body, you 
can talk to health, you can talk to your bank account, you can talk to the air molecules, you can 
communicate through the ethers about what kind of world you want to live in, you know, peaceful, 
open arms, immigrants welcome, people helping people, feed people that need food, give water to 
people that need water and animals that need water, etc.  
 
So this is a very good time to put in all of your well wishes and focus on what you do want. Where 
you want the ball to land, so to speak. On a more personal level, certainly, again “I choose health” 
“I choose wealth”, “I choose happiness”, “I choose the perfect living place or the perfect 
relationship partner” whatever it is. So lots of positive thinking. Lots of positive affirmations. Write 
them down. Perhaps even make a collage because images are very important and may also help 
program the cellular structure.  

 
Alright Dear Ones. As always, thank you and my love to you.  
 
 

Djwhal Khul  

Channeled by Rev. Terri Newlon www.TerriNewlon.com 

Follow Djwhal Khul on Twitter! http://twitter.com/DKupdate 

Join Terri on Facebook http://www.facebook.com/terri.newlon 

Join our e-newsletter http://terrinewlon.com/ 

Training for Modern Mystics Channeled Teachings for Everyday Spirituality Online Resource for 
Personal and Spiritual Growth www.TerriNewlon.com 

(Spirituality Article, Transcribed by Micheline Ralet) 

About Reverend Terri: 

Terri Newlon is a world renowned spiritual teacher and conscious voice channel for Ascended 
Master Djwhal Khul. Djwhal Khul has worked through numerous channels, including Madam H.P. 
Blavatsky and Alice A. Bailey, and is well known to spiritual students. His work through Terri began 
in 1980 when she studied under Janet McClure and The Tibetan Foundation, Inc., and has resulted 
in an extensive online global support system of practical spiritual teachings. 

She is also a gifted health Empath and has trained thousands of mediums and psychics. One of her 

specialties is instructing other natural sensitives how to turn on and off their abilities so they can 
live well-balanced lives, without neglecting their own physical, emotional, mental and spiritual 
requirements. 

Terri is a workshop leader, holistic consultant, public speaker, radio and TV guest. 

Disclaimer: 

Rev. Terri Newlon does not guarantee the accuracy of her insights and is in no way responsible for 
the interpretation of this material. The recipient is 100% responsible for any action taken based on 
their interpretation of the insights presented in any channeled material. Channeled material 
presented through Rev. Terri is in no way meant to replace sound economical, political, medical, 
legal or any other advice and does not provide prophecy, or guaranteed accuracy on future 
predictions. The information is meant as a guideline only and to help Humanity better reflect upon 
themselves, where they have been, where they are now and where they potentially may be going. 
By asking for or otherwise acquiring this material, you agree to use your own discernment, and you 
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release Rev. Terri, and Terri Newlon, Inc. from any and all legal or moral responsibility. 
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